
 
 

 

Union 2019 Street Repair  
Program Public Bid Opening  
May 28th, 2019 at 3:30 pm  
Projects 

       CONTRACTOR 1 
  
Michels  
     Contractor Bids 

      CONTRACTOR 2 
 
 Bluegrass 
    Contractor Bids 

       CONTRACTOR 3 
  
Eaton 
    Contractor Bids 

      CONTRACTOR 4 
 
 Riegler 
    Contractor Bids 

PHASE A PARTS 1, 2, 3 & 4     
Phase A Part 1A (Full Resurfacing) 
Old Union Rd  

69,673.50 69,938.29 83,719.50 67,592.50 

Phase A Part 1B (Full Resurfacing) 
Ashton Court (South)  

14,524.00 14,646.66 22,350.00 12,510.00 

Phase A Part 1C (Full Resurfacing) 
Hempsteade Drive 

72,283.00 72,394.64 82,722.50 60,800.00 

Phase A Part 1D (Full Resurfacing) 
Mountain Laurel Way 

25,790.50 23,564.21 31,607.00 25,907.50 

Phase A Part 1E (Full Resurfacing) 
Picket Run 

21.556.50 18,598.03 29,601.00 19,695.00 

TOTAL PHASE A PART 1 203,827.50 199,141.83 250,000.00 186,505.00 
     
Phase A Part 2 (Joint Sealing) 
Indian Hill Dr, Lakepoint & 
Daybreak Courts  

11,625.00 17,205.00 No Bid 5,825.00 

TOTAL PHASE A PART 2 11,635.00 17,205.00 No Bid 5,825.00 
     
Phase A Part 3 (Asphalt 
Base/Surface Repairs – 171 SY) 

13,680.00 11,821.23 No Bid 15,800.00 

TOTAL PHASE A PART 3 13,680.00 11,821.23 No Bid 15,800.00 
     
PHASE A PART 4 (Pot Holes - 28) 6,075.00 8,804.94 No Bid 4,050.00 
TOTAL PHASE A PART 4 6,075.00 8,804.94 No Bid 4,050.00 
     
TOTAL BID PHASE A  
PARTS 1, 2,3 & 4 

235,207.50 236,973.00 250,000.00 212,180.00 

     
PHASE B (Concrete Curb & Gutter 
- 646 LF) 
TOTAL BID PHASE B  

45,074.00 No Bid No Bid 66,400.00 

     
PHASE C (Edge/Side Drain System 
– Bayswater Drive) 
TOTAL BID PHASE C 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 17,700.00 

     
TOTAL BID PHASES A, B & C 280,281.50 236,973.00 250,000.00 296,280.00 
     
Surety/Performance Bond For 
Review By City Attorney 

Yes __X___ No _____ Yes _X____ No _____ Yes __X___ No _____ Yes ___X__ No _____ 

Contractor Ins. For Review by 
the Roeding Group 

Yes _____ No _X____ Yes _____ No ___X__ Yes __X___ No _____ Yes _____ No __X___ 


