

2018 Union Street Repairs Program Bid Results, May 29, 2018

PROJECTS	Bluegrass Paving,	Paul Michels & Sons,	Len Riegler	Straight Edge
	Inc.	Inc.	Blacktop, Inc.	LLC
Phase A – Part 1 (Old Union Road Resurfacing)	63,900.00	\$69,461.75	69,106.50	No Bid
Phase A – Part 2 (Glenfield Court Reconstruction)	No Bid	\$26,780.00	26,005.00	No Bid
Phase A - Part 3 Deepwood Court Resurfacing)	No Bid	\$7,945.50	9,190.00	No Bid
Phase A-Part 3 B Hempsteade Drive Resurfacing)	No Bid	\$5,423.50	6,605.00	No Bid
Phase A-Part 4 Asphalt Base Surfacing	No Bid	\$4,180.00	3,080.00	No Bid
Phase A-Part 5 Line Striping-Speed Humps	No Bid	\$89,900.00	8,100.00	No Bid
TOTAL BID PHASE A	63,900.00	\$203,689.75	122,086.50	\$0.00
Phase B – Part 1 Concrete Curb and Gutter	No Bid	No Bid	58,925.00	\$82,475.00
Phase B – Part 2 ADA Wheelchair Ramps	No Bid	No Bid	32,000.00	\$18,400.00
TOTAL BID PHASE B	0.00	\$0.00	90,925.00	\$100,875.00
Phase C Part 1= Edge/Side Drains Bayberry Lane	No Bid	No Bid	11,690.00	\$9,267.50
Phase C Part 2 Braxton Road (E/SD)	No Bid	No Bid	18,940.00	\$17,022.50
Phase C Part 3 -Fireside Court (E/SD)	No Bid	No Bid	15,536.00	\$13,801.00
Phase C Part 4-Whittlesey Drive (E/SD)	No Bid	No Bid	14,290.00	\$11,835.00
Phase C Part 5-Laurawoods Court	No Bid	No Bid	8,275.00	\$4,208.50
Total Bid Phase C	0.00	\$0.00	68,731.00	\$56,134.50
Surety/Performance Bond	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>
Contractor Ins. Requirements for review by the Roeding Group	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>	Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No <input type="checkbox"/>